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Performance Requirements  

Instructions: 

Bidders submitting a proposal must complete and submit an Attachment C for evaluation purposes.     

Performance Requirements: Bidder must respond to each requirement as noted in the instructions below. 

1. Review all requirements, priorities and provided definitions:  
• Mandatory Pass/Fail (M): Minimum requirement; Bidder that does not meet this requirement will not be considered any further. 
• Mandatory Scored (MS): Critical requirement; evaluators will score based on the degree to which Bidder's response meets the requirement.   
• Desirable Scored (DS): Desirable requirement; evaluators will score based on the degree to which Bidder's response meets the requirement. 

2. Using the Bidder Meets Requirement column, Bidder must select either a "Yes" or "No" to indicate the Bidder's ability to meet the 
requirement.  Any entry that is not either a "Yes" or "No", may be deemed non-responsive and will not be considered any further. 

3. Bidder must respond in the Written Response column for every requirement that indicates a "Written Response Required”.  Written responses 
must not reference any material present elsewhere.  The written response shall be considered complete and stand on its own merits or may be 
deemed non-responsive. 

PERFORMANCE REQUIREMENTS AND FACTORS 

REQ 
ID 

Performance Requirement and 

Stated Business Need 

Points 
Available 

Priority Bidder’s 
Compliance 

Written Response 

1. Bidder must have an existing website with the 
ability for Purchasers to complete online orders. 

 

15 DS ☐ Yes 

☒ No 

Website – www.pack4promos.com – is a catalog of thousands of 
products that potential customers can browse. For security 
reasons and to interact personally with Purchasers, I do not offer 
the option to order products directly from my website. Instead, a 
Purchaser sends me an inquiry about a particular product, and I 
contact the Purchaser to create a purchase order. 

Competitive 
Solicitation: 

No. RFP23-022 

Bidder: Pack 4 Enterprises LLC 
Type/print full legal name of bidder company 

http://www.pack4promos.com/


PERFORMANCE REQUIREMENTS AND FACTORS 

REQ 
ID 

Performance Requirement and 

Stated Business Need 

Points 
Available 

Priority Bidder’s 
Compliance 

Written Response 

2. Website has online product catalog with product 
specifications, manufacturer product numbers and 
the contracted price. 

 

15 DS ☒ Yes 

☐ No 

My website includes manufacturer product specifications 
and the retail price, but does not include the contracted 
price.  

3. Website has functionality to search, sort and filter 
the online product catalog. 

 

15 DS ☒ Yes 

☐ No 

My website has functionality to search, sort and filter the 
online product catalog. 

5. Website shows product availability; i.e., quantity of 
items left in stock. 

 

15 DS ☐ Yes 

☒ No 

To check inventory, Purchaser must send an email to 
karen@pack4enterprises.com 

5. Website has online ordering system configurable 
by each Purchaser - products offering, delivery 
requirements and payments. 

 

15 DS ☐ Yes 

☒ No 

Website does not include an online ordering system 
configurable to each Purchaser. Purchaser sends me an 
inquiry about a particular product, and I contact the 
Purchaser to create a purchase order. 

 

Return this attachment to Procurement Coordinator at: 
contracts.office@mil.wa.gov 

 



Item No Description SOQ Item idding SOQ Itemnative to SOQ nk to AlternativList Price% off Final Price
1 Men's Under Armour Running Shoes Men's UA Surge 3 Yes 63.00$      
2 Women's Under Armour Running Shoes Women's UA Surge 3 Yes 63.00$      
3 Men's 8" Tactical Boot Rocky 8" Boot Yes 75.00$      
4a Men's Cotton T-shirt - Black, S-XL Port & Company PC61 Yes 3.25$        
4b Men's Cotton T-shirt - Black, 2X Port & Company PC61 Yes 5.85$        
4c Men's Cotton T-shirt - Black, 3X, 4X Port & Company PC61 Yes 6.90$        
5a Men's Crewneck Sweatshirt - Hth, S-XL Port & Company PC78 Yes 8.70$        
5b Men's Crewneck Sweatshirt - Hth, 2X Port & Company PC78 Yes 10.90$      
5c Men's Crewneck Sweatshirt - Hth, 3X, 4X Port & Company PC78 Yes 11.80$      
6a Men's Fleece Sweatpant - Hth, S-XL Port & Company PC90P Yes 12.20$      
6b Men's Fleece Sweatpant - Hth, 2X Port & Company PC90P Yes 15.75$      
6c Men's Fleece Sweatpant - Hth, 3X, 4X Port & Company PC90P Yes 16.60$      
7a Men's 9" Athletic Short, S-XL Sport-Tek ST355P Yes 7.99$        
7b Men's 9" Athletic Short, 2X Sport-Tek ST355P Yes 9.15$        
7c Men's 9" Athletic Short, 3X Sport-Tek ST355P Yes 11.40$      
7d Men's 9" Athletic Short, 4X Sport-Tek ST355P Yes 12.65$      
8 BDU Trouser, Cotton Ripstop -OD Propper® BDU Trouser Yes 31.19$      
9 BDU Coat, Cotton Ripstop - OD Propper® BDU Coat Yes 31.19$      
10 Tru-Spec H2O Proof Parka - Blk H2O Proof ECWCS Gen2 Parka Yes 112.00$   
11 Rothco Pistol Belt - OD Rothco Pistol Belts Yes 9.45$        
12 Rothco Web Belt - Blk Rothco Nylon Web Belt Yes 5.25$        
13 Rothco Web Belt Buckle - Blk Rothco Web Belt Buckles Yes 1.20$        
14 Rothco Boot Laces Rothco Boot Laces 72 Inches Yes 3.45$        
15 Rothco Wool Glove Liner - Blk Rothco Wool Glove Liners Yes 6.20$        
16 Rothco Patrol Cap - OD Rothco Fatigue Caps Yes 5.80$        
17 Rothco Boonie Cap - OD Rothco Boonie Hat Yes 9.80$        
18 Rothco Fleece Watch Cap - Blk Rothco Fleece Watch Cap Yes 4.95$        
19 Boot Polish Kit KIWI® Shoe Shine Kit No Yes iwi Shoe Care Kit 21.50$      
20 Thermal Underwear Bottom - Blk Thermal Underwear Bottoms Yes 11.55$      
21 Thermal Underwear Top - Blk Thermal Underwear Top Yes 11.55$      
22 Men's Compression Shorts - Blk Men's Compression Shorts No bid -$          
23 Women's Compression Shorts - Blk Women's Compression Shorts No bid -$          
24 Men's Boxer Briefs Men's Boxer Briefs Yes 4.50$        

https://www.underarmour.com/en-us/p/running/mens_ua_surge_3_running_shoes/3024883.html
https://www.underarmour.com/en-us/p/running/womens_ua_surge_3_running_shoes/3024894.html
https://www.rockyboots.com/rocky/rocky-havoc-public-service-boot/RKD0076.html
https://www.sanmar.com/p/1634_JetBlack#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/1634_JetBlack#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/1634_JetBlack#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/4179_AthlHthr#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/4179_AthlHthr#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/4179_AthlHthr#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/2203_AthlHthr?text=PC90P
https://www.sanmar.com/p/2203_AthlHthr?text=PC90P
https://www.sanmar.com/p/2203_AthlHthr?text=PC90P
https://www.sanmar.com/p/8766_TrueNavy#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/8766_TrueNavy#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/8766_TrueNavy#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/8766_TrueNavy#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.propper.com/propperr-bdu-trouser-button-fly-100-cotton-ripstop.html?variation=247_1805-259_1701
https://www.propper.com/propperr-bdu-coat-100-cotton-ripstop.html?variation=247_1805-263_1743
https://www.truspec.com/outerwear/h2o-proof-outerwear/h2o-proof-gen2-ecwcs-parka/
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-new-issue-marine-corps-style-quick-release-pistol-belts
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-web-belt-nylon
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-web-belt-buckles
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-boot-laces-72-3-pack
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-wool-glove-liners-unstamped
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-fatigue-caps
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-100-cotton-rip-stop-boonie-hat
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-polar-fleece-watch-cap
https://www.kiwicare.com/en-us/products/kiwi-shoe-shine-kit
https://www.rothco.com/product/kiwi-military-shoe-care-kit
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-thermal-knit-underwear-bottoms
https://www.rothco.com/product/rothco-thermal-knit-underwear-top
https://www.amazon.com/TELALEO-Compression-Performance-Baselayer-Underwear/dp/B094JKXP76/ref=sr_1_1_sspa?crid=ABY5U6XUZWJ2&keywords=men%27s%2Bcompression%2Bshorts&qid=1680732773&sprefix=men%27s%2Bcompression%2Bshorts%2Caps%2C161&sr=8-1-spons&spLa=ZW5jcnlwdGVkUXVhbGlmaWVyPUEySjBaS1ZWMTE3UDZCJmVuY3J5cHRlZElkPUEwOTg0NTU2Uk1GWjlSNzlESDdOJmVuY3J5cHRlZEFkSWQ9QTAxODk0NzJGNTYxRFhTT1BCNDgmd2lkZ2V0TmFtZT1zcF9hdGYmYWN0aW9uPWNsaWNrUmVkaXJlY3QmZG9Ob3RMb2dDbGljaz10cnVl&th=1&psc=1
https://www.amazon.com/wirarpa-Underwear-Chafing-Leggings-Panties/dp/B08S6P5XR9/ref=sr_1_1_sspa?crid=VYOAQXN4SMRN&keywords=women%27s%2Bcompression%2Bshorts&qid=1680732911&sprefix=women%27s%2Bcompression%2Bshorts%2Caps%2C142&sr=8-1-spons&spLa=ZW5jcnlwdGVkUXVhbGlmaWVyPUExVzdITFpXUEwwNFpXJmVuY3J5cHRlZElkPUEwODkwMzU1MVJXSUw2MUJFREQwWCZlbmNyeXB0ZWRBZElkPUEwNDM2MDI5NjdSRElORFRNTkw2JndpZGdldE5hbWU9c3BfYXRmJmFjdGlvbj1jbGlja1JlZGlyZWN0JmRvTm90TG9nQ2xpY2s9dHJ1ZQ&th=1&psc=1
https://www.pack4promos.com/p/UCMRJ-MFLXM/activ-pro-mens-boxer-briefs---assorted-colors-s---xl-2-pack-case-o


** SOLD IN CASE LOTS ONLY - 144 pcs/case, price is per piece
25 Women's Brief Underwear - Blk Women's Brief Underwear No bid -$          
26 Women's Sports Bra - Blk or Gry Women's Sports Bra No bid -$          
27 Tube Sock - Blk Unisex Tube Sock No bid -$          
28 Thermal Boot Sock Thermal Boot Socks No Yes Thermal Boot Sock 1.85$        
** SOLD IN CASE LOTS ONLY - 120 pcs/case, price is per piece
29 Shower Shoes/Sandals V-Strap Shower Shoes No bid -$          

https://www.amazon.com/Amazon-Essentials-Womens-Cotton-Stretch/dp/B06XKSR4R2/ref=sr_1_33?crid=1V00S9VDU9KZ3&keywords=women%27s%2Bbrief%2Bunderwear&qid=1680733123&sprefix=women%27s%2Bbrief%2Bunderwear%2Caps%2C164&sr=8-33&th=1&psc=1
https://www.amazon.com/gp/product/B07XHZXP56/ref=ppx_yo_dt_b_search_asin_title?ie=UTF8&th=1&psc=1
https://www.amazon.com/SOCKSNBULK-Pairs-Wholesale-Cotton-Unisex/dp/B07YCSCDDF/ref=sr_1_8?crid=33T5H1P2UZENR&keywords=bulk%2Bblack%2Btube%2Bsock&qid=1680733672&sprefix=bulk%2Bblack%2Btube%2Bsock%2Caps%2C161&sr=8-8&th=1
https://www.amazon.com/Yacht-Smith-Thermal-Camping-Assorted/dp/B00LI3SY24/ref=sr_1_14_sspa?crid=3GP0UQVOD875C&keywords=Bulk%2Bthermal%2Bboot%2Bsock&qid=1681257371&sprefix=bulk%2Bthermal%2Bboot%2Bsock%2B%2Caps%2C161&sr=8-14-spons&smid=A2N43JHNO0NHQ7&spLa=ZW5jcnlwdGVkUXVhbGlmaWVyPUEzR1pHUDczM0NVOEdGJmVuY3J5cHRlZElkPUEwNjk4MzAzSlZGQ0VaQlFUMFo4JmVuY3J5cHRlZEFkSWQ9QTAzNjIxODQzRjBHVDAyMFhEWFlJJndpZGdldE5hbWU9c3BfbXRmJmFjdGlvbj1jbGlja1JlZGlyZWN0JmRvTm90TG9nQ2xpY2s9dHJ1ZQ&th=1&psc=1
https://www.dollardays.com/i1935420-wholesale-multicolor-thermal-socks-sizes-10-13-assorted-colors.html
https://www.charm-tex.com/v-strap-thongs-9914.html


Item No. Description SOQ Item Bidding SOQ Itemrnative to SOQ Ink to AlternativList Price % off Final Price
1 Uniform Coat - OCP PROPPER OCP Uniform Coat Yes 62.17$         
2 Uniform Trousers - OCP PROPPER Uniform Trouser Yes 62.17$         
3 Patrol Cap - OCP Propper OCP Patrol Cap Yes 9.15$           
4 T-shirt - Tan 499 Propper Pack 3® T-Shirt Yes 22.90$         
5 Tactical Duty Belt - Tan 499 PROPPER™ Duty Belt Yes 8.20$           
6 8" Tactical Boot - Coyote, AR670-1 Series 100 8" Boots Yes 88.30$         
7 Campaign Hat - Black Stratton Campaign Hat No bid -$             
8 Men's Hooded Sweatshirt - Black  CADRE, S-Port & Company PC78H Yes 24.75$         
** Price inc white screenprint WYA crest on left chest and 'CADRE' on back
9 Men's Cotton T-shirt - Black  CADRE Port & Company PC61 Yes 15.30$         
** Price inc white screenprint WYA crest on left chest and 'CADRE' on back
10a Men's Fleece Sweatpants - Black, S-XL Port & Company PC90P Yes 12.20$         
10b Men's Fleece Sweatpants - Black, 2X Port & Company PC90P Yes 15.75$         
10c Men's Fleece Sweatpants - Black, 3X, 4X Port & Company PC90P Yes 16.60$         
11a Men's 9" Athletic Shorts - Black, S-XL Sport-Tek ST355P Yes 7.99$           
11b Men's 9" Athletic Shorts - Black, 2X Sport-Tek ST355P Yes 9.15$           
11c Men's 9" Athletic Shorts - Black, 3X Sport-Tek ST355P Yes 11.40$         
11d Men's 9" Athletic Shorts - Black, 4X Sport-Tek ST355P Yes 12.65$         

https://www.galls.com/propper-ocp-acu-coat?PMSRCH=OCP%20Uniform%20Coat
https://www.galls.com/propper-ocp-acu-trouser?PMSRCH=OCP%20Uniform%20Trousers
https://www.galls.com/propper-nyco-ripstop-acu-patrol-cap?PMSRCH=patrol%20cap
https://www.propper.com/propper-pack-3r-military-t-shirt.html?variation=247_2015
https://www.propper.com/tactical-duty-belt.html?variation=247_2015
https://www.propper.com/military-boots/propper-series-100-8-boot.html
https://www.galls.com/hw795-stratton-straw-single-brim-campaign-hat?PMSRCH=Campaign%20hat
https://www.sanmar.com/p/4180_JetBlack#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/1634_JetBlack#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/2203_JetBlack#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/2203_JetBlack#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/2203_JetBlack#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/8766_Black#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/8766_Black#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/8766_Black#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/8766_Black#?doScrollToGrid=true


Item No. Description SOQ Item Bidding SOQ Itemnative to SOQ ink to AlternativList Price % off Final Price
1a Fleece Jackets - Black WYCA, S-XL Crossland Fleece Jacket No Yes  hority Value Fleece Jacket 39.90$       
1b Fleece Jackets - Black WYCA,2X Crossland Fleece Jacket No Yes  hority Value Fleece Jacket 40.75$       
1c Fleece Jackets - Black WYCA, 3X Crossland Fleece Jacket No Yes  hority Value Fleece Jacket 42.40$       
1d Fleece Jackets - Black WYCA, 4X Crossland Fleece Jacket No Yes  hority Value Fleece Jacket 44.70$       
Price includes WYCA embroidery on left chest up to a maximum of 5000 stitches
2a Men's Colorblock Polo - Heather/Navy WYCA  Challenger Colorblock Polo No Yes tTek Colorblock Polo 38.75$       
2b Men's Colorblock Polo - Heather/Navy WYCA  Challenger Colorblock Polo No Yes tTek Colorblock Polo 39.70$       
2c Men's Colorblock Polo - Heather/Navy WYCA  Challenger Colorblock Polo No Yes tTek Colorblock Polo 41.95$       
2d Men's Colorblock Polo - Heather/Navy WYCA  Challenger Colorblock Polo No Yes tTek Colorblock Polo 43.80$       
Price includes WYCA embroidery on left chest up to a maximum of 5000 stitches
3a Ladies Colorblock Polo - Heather/Navy WYCA  Challenger Colorblock Polo No Yes tTek Colorblock Polo 38.75$       
3b Ladies Colorblock Polo - Heather/Navy WYCA  Challenger Colorblock Polo No Yes tTek Colorblock Polo 39.70$       
3c Ladies Colorblock Polo - Heather/Navy WYCA  Challenger Colorblock Polo No Yes tTek Colorblock Polo 41.95$       
3d Ladies Colorblock Polo - Heather/Navy WYCA  Challenger Colorblock Polo No Yes tTek Colorblock Polo 43.80$       
Price includes WYCA embroidery on left chest up to a maximum of 5000 stitches
4a Men's Pique Polo - Black WYCA, S-XL Superblend Pique Polo No Yes  uthority Silk Touch Polo 36.60$       
4b Men's Pique Polo - Black WYCA, 2X Superblend Pique Polo No Yes  uthority Silk Touch Polo 37.80$       
4c Men's Pique Polo - Black WYCA, 3X Superblend Pique Polo No Yes  uthority Silk Touch Polo 39.20$       
4d Men's Pique Polo - Black WYCA, 4X Superblend Pique Polo No Yes  uthority Silk Touch Polo 41.70$       
Price includes WYCA embroidery on left chest up to a maximum of 5000 stitches
5a Ladie's Pique Polo - Black WYCA, S-XL Superblend Pique Polo No Yes  uthority Silk Touch Polo 36.60$       
5b Ladie's Pique Polo - Black WYCA, 2X Superblend Pique Polo No Yes  uthority Silk Touch Polo 37.80$       
5c Ladie's Pique Polo - Black WYCA, 3X Superblend Pique Polo No Yes  uthority Silk Touch Polo 39.20$       
5d Ladie's Pique Polo - Black WYCA, 4X Superblend Pique Polo No Yes  uthority Silk Touch Polo 41.70$       
Price includes WYCA embroidery on left chest up to a maximum of 5000 stitches

https://www.4imprint.com/product/123990-M/Crossland-Fleece-Jacket-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/4513_Black#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/4513_Black#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/4513_Black#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.sanmar.com/p/4513_Black#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.4imprint.com/product/122092-M/Heathered-Challenger-Colorblock-Polo-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/6035_VtgHTrNvy#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.4imprint.com/product/122092-M/Heathered-Challenger-Colorblock-Polo-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/6035_VtgHTrNvy#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.4imprint.com/product/122092-M/Heathered-Challenger-Colorblock-Polo-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/6035_VtgHTrNvy#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.4imprint.com/product/122092-M/Heathered-Challenger-Colorblock-Polo-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/6035_VtgHTrNvy#?doScrollToGrid=true
https://www.4imprint.com/product/122092-L/Heathered-Challenger-Colorblock-Polo-Ladies
https://www.sanmar.com/p/6030_VtgHTrNvy
https://www.4imprint.com/product/122092-L/Heathered-Challenger-Colorblock-Polo-Ladies
https://www.sanmar.com/p/6030_VtgHTrNvy
https://www.4imprint.com/product/122092-L/Heathered-Challenger-Colorblock-Polo-Ladies
https://www.sanmar.com/p/6030_VtgHTrNvy
https://www.4imprint.com/product/122092-L/Heathered-Challenger-Colorblock-Polo-Ladies
https://www.sanmar.com/p/6030_VtgHTrNvy
https://www.4imprint.com/product/5752-M/Superblend-Pique-Polo-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/7744_Black
https://www.4imprint.com/product/5752-M/Superblend-Pique-Polo-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/7744_Black
https://www.4imprint.com/product/5752-M/Superblend-Pique-Polo-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/7744_Black
https://www.4imprint.com/product/5752-M/Superblend-Pique-Polo-Mens
https://www.sanmar.com/p/7744_Black
https://www.4imprint.com/product/5752-L/Superblend-Pique-Polo-Ladies
https://www.sanmar.com/p/7745_Black
https://www.4imprint.com/product/5752-L/Superblend-Pique-Polo-Ladies
https://www.sanmar.com/p/7745_Black
https://www.4imprint.com/product/5752-L/Superblend-Pique-Polo-Ladies
https://www.sanmar.com/p/7745_Black
https://www.4imprint.com/product/5752-L/Superblend-Pique-Polo-Ladies
https://www.sanmar.com/p/7745_Black
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